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9/3/18 Gmail - your article

your article

iji@ogu.edu.tr <iji@ogu.edu.tr> Thu, Aug 23, 2018 at 6:48 AM
To: maisarohmay65@gmail.com, slametph@uny.ac.id, samsul_hd@uny.ac.id

Dear author,
First of all, we apologrze for the delay m order to respond to you
We received your article. Thank you very much for your interest in LJI.

After a pre-assessment with careful consideration by the members of the Editorial Board and Executive
Committee, your article was decided to be accepted for further evaluation processes. But, our journal writing
and referencing rules are to be taken into consideration for articles sent us. We attached sample
“iji_model". To use this template, just delete the unwanted text and start typing or cutting and

pasting. Could you please revise your article according to this and re-send us via e-mail (iji@ogu.edu.tr) as
an attached file?

Meanwhile, the authors of the articles that are accepted for publication should pay a fee of 200 EUR as an
author share of production costs. Articles will be published after payment. If it is acceptable for you, let us
know, and then we will start article evaluation process. We will send you account information after
evaluation process, if your article accepted for publication. (Note: 200 EUR be paid by all authors of an article
all together. Each author does not pay separately.)

Note: Could you please confirm the receipt of this e-mail?
Sincerely yours,

Editorial
Intemational Journal of Instruction

Intemational Journal of Instruction
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Maisaroh may <maisarohmay65@gmail.com> Thu, Aug 23, 2018 at 8:23 AM
To: iji@ogu.edu.tr

Dear Editor
Yes. | will revise my manuscript
Thanks very much for your consideration

Sincerely Your

Siti Maisaroh
[Quoted text hidden]
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™1 Gmail
Revision of Manuscript

Maisaroh may <maisarchmay65@gmail.com> Thu, Aug 30, 2018 at 6:32 AM
To: iji@ogu.edu.tr

Dear Editorial Intemational Joumal of Instruction
| have revMsed my manuscript
Thank very much for your response

Sincerely Yours
Siti Maisaroh

__ The Budget_Planning_Determinant_Factors_at_State anary
) Schools_in_Yogyakarta_Province (.doc
261K

iji@ogu.edu.tr <iji@ogu.edu.tr> Thu, Aug 30, 2018 at 7:13 PM
To: maisarohmay65 <maisarohmay65@gmail.com>, slametph@uny.ac.id, samsul_hd@uny.ac.id

Dear author,
We received your article. Thank you very much for your interest in [J1.

Meanwhile, the authors of the articles that are accepted for publication should pay a fee 0f 200 EUR as
an author share of production costs. Articles will be published after payment. If it is acceptable for you,
let us know, and then we will start article evaluation process. We will send you account nformation
after evaluation process, if your article accepted for publication. (Note: 200 EUR be paid by all authors
of an article all together. Each author does not pay separately.)

Note: Could you please confirm the receipt of this e-mail?

Sincerely yours,
Editorial
International Journal of Instruction

From: “maisarohmay65" <maisarohmay65@gmail.com>
To: iji@ogu.edu.tr

Sent: Thursday, August 30, 2018 2:32:50 AM

Subject: Rewvision of Manuscript

[Quoted text hidden]

Maisaroh may <maisarohmay65@gmail.com> Fri, Aug 31, 2018 at 5:16 AM
To: iji@ogu.edu.tr

Dear Editor
Yes. | agreed to pay the production costs
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9/3/18 Gmail - Revision of Manuscript
Sincerely Yours
Siti Maisaroh
[Quoted text hidden]

iji@ogu.edu.tr <iji@ogu.edu.tr> Sat, Sep 1, 2018 at 7:05 PM
To: maisarohmay65 <maisarohmay65@gmail.com>, slametph@uny.ac.id, samsul_hd@uny.ac.id

Dear author
We sent your article to reviewers. Thank you very much for your interest in IJI.

Sincerely yours,
Editorial
International Journal of Instruction

From: "maisarohmay65" <maisarohmay85@gmail.com>
To: iji@ogu.edu.tr

Sent: Friday, August 31, 2018 1:16:53 AM

Subject: Re: Revision of Manuscript

[Quoted text hidden]
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21/9/2020 Gmail - Re: Revision of Manuscript

M Gma |i Siti Maisaroh <maisaroh.siti@gmail.com>
Re: Revision of Manuscript

1 pesan

International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com> 7 Maret 2019 06.11

Kepada: maisarohmay65@gmail.com, slametph@uny.ac.id, Samsul Hadi <samsul_hd@uny.ac.id>,
maisaroh.siti@gmail.com

Dear author,

Your article has completed the reviewing process and has been accepted for publication. We will
schedule your manuscript for publication in April 2019 after you pay author share of production costs of
200 Euro in a week. Meanwhile, if you want and pay an extra +100 Euro we can publish your article
now as OnlineFirst http://www.e-iji.net/volumes/354-onlinefirst-2

You can transfer Euro via PayPal. (Note: All extra fees per transaction for bank charges (intermediary
and local banks) belong to the author. After payment the fee will not be refunded.) Could you please
absolutely let us know the payer's (sender) PayPal account?

Our PayPal account is https://www.paypal.me/gatejournals

Sincerely yours,
Publishing Officer
International Journal of Instruction

From: "maisarohmay65" <maisarohmay65@gmail.com>
To: iji@ogu.edu.tr

Sent: Friday, August 31, 2018 1:16:53 AM

Subject: Re: Revision of Manuscript

Dear Editor
Yes. | agreed to pay the production costs

Sincerely Yours
Siti Maisaroh

On Thu, Aug 30, 2018 at 7:13 PM <iji@ogu.edu.tr> wrote:
Dear author,

We received your article. Thank you very much for your interest in IJI.

Meanwhile, the authors of the articles that are accepted for publication should pay a fee of 200 EUR as
an author share of production costs. Articles will be published after payment. If it is acceptable for you,
let us know, and then we will start article evaluation process. We will send you account information
after evaluation process, if your article accepted for publication. (Note: 200 EUR be paid by all authors
of an article all together. Each author does not pay separately.)

Note: Could you please confirm the receipt of this e-mail?

Sincerely yours,
Editorial
International Journal of Instruction
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21/9/2020 Gmail - Re: Revision of Manuscript

From: "maisarohmay65" <maisarohmay65@gmail.com>
To: iji@ogu.edu.tr

Sent: Thursday, August 30, 2018 2:32:50 AM

Subject: Revision of Manuscript

Dear Editorial International Journal of Instruction
| have revised my manuscript
Thank very much for your response

Sincerely Yours
Siti Maisaroh

International Journal of Instruction
http://www.e-iji.net
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M Gma I' Siti Maisaroh <maisaroh.siti@gmail.com>
(tanpa subjek)

1 pesan

International Journal of Instruction <editor.eiji@gmail.com> 13 Maret 2019 06.56

Kepada: maisarohmay65@gmail.com, slametph@uny.ac.id, Samsul Hadi <samsul_hd@uny.ac.id>, Siti Maisaroh
<maisaroh.siti@gmail.com>

You can see your article on: http://www.e-iji.net/volumes/354-onlinefirst-2

International Journal of Instruction
http://lwww.e-iji.net
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